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NEW SOLIDARITY INTERNATIONAL PRESS SERVICE 

Third World Nations Hesitate On Debt Moratorium 

Oct. 10 (NSIPS) - During the second week of the 31st session of 
the United Nations General Assembly here, foreign ministers 
and ambassadors from the Third World declined to take the lead 
given them by the speeches last week for immediate debt 
moratorium and a new world economic order by Guyana's 
foreign minister Frederick Wills and Italy's foreign minister 
Arnaldo Forlani. The developing nations, on the whole com­
mitted to the resolutions put forward at the Colombo Conference 
of Non-Aligned nations in August, are still seeking to win their 
demands through continued negotiations with the murderous 
U.S. Secretary of State Henry Kissinger. 

In the week's time permitted him by their hesitation, Henry 
Kissinger has perpetrated the bloody coup in Thailand, (see 
special report below on South East Asia), and launched a global 
terror campaign which resulted in the death of 78 passangers of 
a Cuban plane on its way from Guyana to Havana. 

. 

In an official statement released Oct. 2 and widely circulated 
at the United Nations, U.S. Labor Party presidential candidate 
Lyndon LaRouche declared that the responsibility to bring down 
the Eurodollar market and with it smash the power of the 
Rockefeller political and terror machine now lies with the op­
position forces of the advanced sector industrialized nations. 

After his boastful blackmailing speech before the United 
Nations General Assembly last week, Kissinger himself has 
stayed on at the United Nations for a full week of backroom 
arm twisting and extortion. Acting as the soft cop of the affair, 
Rep. Charles Diggs, a black Democrat, has arrived on the scene 
to cajole black nations representatives. Digs is telling Third 
World delegations that Jimmy Carter is a shooin for the 
November presidential elections and that Carter will take a 
more conciliatory position toward Third World demands. Diggs 
also urged African delegations to concern themselves primarily 
with the Rhodesian situation and not preoccupy themselves with 
the fight for a new world economic order. 

The delegate of the People's Republic of China gave its 
presentation to the General Assembly this week, which sur­
passed Kissinger in its diatribes against the Soviet Union. (see 
excerpts below) The Maoist spokesman demonstrated that since 
the death of the senile Mao Tse Tung, the leadership of China 
has not yet laid to rest his insane policies. 

LaRouche to UN 

LaRouche's Oct. 2 press release pointed out that the current 
threats and acts of terrorism by the U.S. Secretary of State are 
"Kissinger's Last Stand:" "Kissinger et a1. ahve fundamentally 
misjudged the global strategic political and economic situation. 

"The cowardly, vacillating figures who foolishly and im­

potently attempt to block debt moratoria are obviously blinding 
themselves to their own cowardice by refusing to recognize 

what is at stake. Fortunately, others are not so weak or foolish. 
Others among us. representing various specific political per­
suasions and perception of immediate self-interest, know that 
we can not pursue those self-interests in a world which does not 
exist. Fortunately, what we temporarily lost, largely through 
cowardice and vacillation, on one front this past week, we 
regained on a much larger scale on other fronts." 

"The most powerful objective source of opposition to Kissin­
ger at this moment is not the Third world, but pro-industrial 
development forces of the industrialized capitalist nations. Any 
continuation of the policies of teh Rockefeller-led faction would 
accomplish a general collapse of industrial production and 
world trade. The industrial forces of the capitalist secotr, a 
more powerful political force at this moment than the entire 
Third World, has been placed in the situation that they must cut 
down Rockefeller in their own desperate interest. The situation 
of the United Kingdom is the paradigm of the problem con­
fronted by the industrialized capitalist nations as a whole. 

"The statements of Guyanan Foreign Minister Fred Wills, 
Italy's Foreign Minister Arnaldo Forlani, and several others at 
the United Nations this past week accurately pointed to these 
circumstances. Those statements should be directly compared 
with this week's major public addresses by Prime Minister 
Callaghan, Italy's Prime Minister Andreotti, a major public 
statement by former French Foreign Minister Andreotti, a 
major public statement by former French Foreign Minister 
Jobert, and the statements by such leading West German of­
ficials as Hans Apel, Otto Wolff von Amerongen, Karl Klasen 
and others. The establishment of an International Development­
type new international monetary system is urgently in the in­
terest of the Third World. In the strategic correlation of forces at 
the moment, it is the anti-Rockefeller forces of the in­
dustrialized capitalist nations which represent far greater 
fighting capacity and strategic clout than the agent and 
vacillator-ridden Group of 77. 

"As we have stipulated repeatedly during the past year and a 
half of our campaign, it has been our strategic estimate that the 
developing nations need only muster themselves to the point of 
credibly weakening the political hegemony of the Rockefeller­
led for�es, thus bringing into play the pro-industrialist forces of 
the industrialized capitalist nations. Once key forces within the 
industrialized capitalist countries mobilized themselves for 
seeking agreement with the Comecon on a pro-development, 
new international monetary system, under conditions of col­
lapse of Rockefeller-linked financial structures, the strategic 
combination needed to prevent depression-collapse and general 
thermonuclear war would come into play. 
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