
Click here for Full Issue of EIR Volume 6, Number 9, March 6, 1979

© 1979 EIR News Service Inc. All Rights Reserved. Reproduction in whole or in part without permission strictly prohibited.

Supt. Siebert dem,ands 
"national policy review" 

New York State Banking Superin­
tendent Muriel Siebert has shaken 
the British banking community with 
a strong caB for "an immediate 
review on the federal level of u.s. 
national policy on foreign bank 
takeovers .... " Mrs. Siebert itemized 
her objections to the ongoing spate 
of British bank purchases in the 
U.S. in a recent letter to Rep. Henry 
Reuss (D-Wisc.), chairman of the 
House Banking Committee, which 
Reuss released in fuB to the press on 
March 1. 

Al l U. S. national bank.ing 
regulatory agencies, including the 
Federal Reserve Board, Comp­
troBer of the Currency, Federal Oe­
Deposit I nsurance Corporation, as 
well as the Securities and Exchange 
Commission, have been forwarded 
the Siebert letter by the House 
Banking Committee. They have 
received along with it a request for a 
full policy review statement, as has 
Rep. St. Germain's (D-R.I.) HO\lse 
Banking Committee Financial In­
stitutions Subcommittee. 

Mrs. Siebert's letter reads in 
part: 

"I am pro-competitive ... (but) 
in the United States there are now 
proposed foreign bank acquisitions 
announced over the past year alone 
totalling $23 billion in U.S. banking 
assets, on top of the $19 billion in 
existing foreign banking assets and 
if these were all accepted it would 
not be in the interests of competi­
tion .... New York has welcomed 
foreign bank branches and agen­
cies ... de nDVD operations are pro­
competitive. .. Our banks for the 
most part started their international 
operations de nDVD rather than 
through acquisitions of existing mj;l­
jor networks abroad .... 

"Regarding the International 
Banking Act of 1978 ... foreign ac-
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quisitions of large domestic banks 
pose serious questions which have 
not  bee n addr essed.... The 
following points must be addressed: 

"1. ReciprDcity: . ,  .On the basis 
of my discussions with my counter­
parts in other countries, no 

developed country other than the 
United States would permit any, 
significant local bank to be acquired 
by a non-d omestic bank. The 
opening of the U.S. banking system 
to foreign acquisitions probably will 
not create equivalent opportunities 
for our banks abroad. 

"2. Fairness: " .. .1 cannot recon­
cile the fact that our own U.S. banks 
operate under s tatu tory and 
regulatory restrictions which, pla<;e 
them at a distinct competitive disad� 
vantage relative to their foreign 
bank competitors in these proposed 
aqui�itions (ie., Citibank would not 
be allowed to purchase the banks 
which the British banks have 
targeted-ed.). 

" 3 . Impact Dn WDridwide Com­
petitive PDsitiDn Df U.S. Banks . . . ' 

"4. Impact Dn CDntrDI Dver U.S. 
Capital ResDurces .... Many foreign 
banks are government-owned or 

controBed and operate in closer har­
mony with their governments than is 
the case he(e. A U.S. bank Dwned by 
a fo.reign bank cDuld carry Dut 
mDnetary Dr .investment pDlicy Df its 

Dwn cD�ntrywhich were in direct CDn­

flict 'with' U.S. pDlicies. These CDn­
flicts cDuld include fDreign exchange 
DperatiDns. dDmestic Dr international 
credit restraint. types Df credit exten­
ded. and levels Df credit allDcated to' 

particular bDrrowers.... (emphasis 
added). 

"5. Amenability and Ability fDr 
Supervision, Df Resulting Institution 
and/Dr Its Parent Bank . . . " Con­
gressional sources have reported, 
that Banking Committee Chairman 
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Reuss is indeed planning near-future 
hearings to investigate the issues 
brought forward in Siebert's letter. 
Such a probe promises to be very 
embarrassing for the City of Lon­
don financial institutions leading the 
banking takeover drive, particularly 
to the Hong Kong and Shanghai 
Banking Corporation, which is 
awaiting a Federal Reserve decision 
on its bid to purchase the con­
trolling interest of the New York-
based Marine Midland Bank. As 
has be e n  d o c u m e n t e d ,  t h e  
"liongShang" is involved up to its 
corporate ledgers in the inter­
national drug trade. A congressional 
investigation should reveal this illicit 
und,erbelly of Hong Shang's business 
enterprises, as well as the corpora­
tion's collusion with other British­
b,ased institutions to take over 

" domestic credit markets and imple­
ment the deindustrialization of the 
USA. 

Reached for comment on the 
Banking Superintendent Siebert's 

,letter, a source at the Hong Shang 
said this week: "All of our worst 

: suspicions about why the Fed has 
h�ld up our acquisition of Marine 
Midland have been confirmed." " ' 

-Kathy Burdman 

Economics 39 

http://www.larouchepub.com/eiw/public/1979/eirv06n09-19790306/index.html

