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.Agriculture by Cynthia Parsons 

Farm crisis bill defeated 

Republicans and Democrats prove how little they know about 
the principles of American agriculture. 

In his June 9 address to the House 
Agriculture Committee, U.S. Agri­
culture Secretary John Block pro­
vided no alternative to shrunken 
farm programs and sweeping bank­
ruptcies. Block rejected the largely 
Democratic compromise legisla­
tion called the Farm Crisis Act of 
1982, because it would "provide 
potential short-term relief for pure­
ly political reasons at the expense of 
the longer-term viability of our ag­
ricultural ind ustry." 

The bill was in fact no solution, 
but Block's reasoning was abso­
lutely wrong. He and Paul Volcker 
will turn U.S. farms into tiny man­
ure-using plots with the slogan 
"agriculture must be free to re­
spond to market conditions," de­
priving the consumer of modern 
food production. 

The Farm Crisis Act was defeat­
ed largely by the Republican mem­
bers of the House Agriculture 
Committee on June 18in a 21-21 tie 
vote. 

At the beginning of the year at 
least 30 Democrats pulled together 
legislation intended to pacify their 
constituents. The defeated bill 
would have reopened the Farm Act 
of 1981, in order to release emer­
gency agricultural credit under 
provisions of the Emergency Agri­
cultural Credit Act of 1978, under 
which no disbursements have been 
made since 1981; and would have 
encouraged exports by an export 
ctedit revolving fund to be funded 
by $1 billion in FY 1983. A further 
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provision called for increasing farm 
storage facilities. 

This effort was a House rejoin­
der to Sen. John Melcher's (D­
Mont.) more comprehensive bill­
which is stuck in committee. That 
bill would not only reopen the 1981 
Farm Act to restore emergency 
loans, but would mandate lower 
interest rates and a return to parity. 
Senate Agriculture Committee 
Chairman Jesse Helms has sta1ed 
that similar bills will be discussed 
this month. 

All the legislation drawn up 
over the past six months, with the 
exception of'Melcher's, reinforced 
the lie that U.S. farmers are over­
producing. The Crisis Act called for 
paying farmers to reduce produc­
tion by keeping fields idle or grow­
ing alternate crops. 

Over the long term, the bill 
would cripple the ability to produce 
excess crops for export or for sale in 
the United States at cheaper prices. 
Under normal conditions, farmers 
can cheapen the cost of production 
by increasing efficiency, and that is 
what most farmers want to do. But 
this can only happen if prices are set 
on the basis of parity, or something 
like 90 percent of the cost of pro­
duction, leaving a margin of profit 
adequate for reinvestment and im­
provements. 

By contrast, the Democratic 
Congressmen's bill would force 
farmers to hold a national referen­
dum to determine whether crop­
land taken out of production would 

be increased to 15 percent starting 
'in 1983. If the referendum passed, 

commodity loan rates would be in­
creased by 10 percent. If it failed, a 
voluntary acreage reduction pro­
gram would go into effect when 
carryover stocks reached predeter­
mined levels. In any case, farmers 
would have to reduce acreage to 
qualify for a loan rate increase. 

Block accurately stated that it 
was "too late" this year to help 
anyone by this means (the 1982 
wheat and feedgrain crops are al­
ready planted) and that a referen­
dum would "leave no choice but to 
implement acreage-reduction pro­
grams." Block stated that the 
"market is signaling that a reduc­
tion in output is needed this year" 
but the reduction should be volun­
tary and at no expense to the gov­
ernment. Block's office explained 
his intent more straightforwardly: 
The "welfare recipients" -benefi­
ciaries of loan rollovers from the 
government-must be axed, mean­
ing some 10-15 percent of U.S. 
farmers. 

Block sees "excess production" 
as a consequence of "excess farm­
ers." His notion of the free market 
is to subject agriculture to the mer­
cies of the Federal Reserve's credit 
dictatorship. Survival of the fittest 
under Paul Volcker's regime means 
that the medium-sized farmer, the 
backbone of modern U.S. agricul­
ture, will be eliminated. As for the 
rest of a hungry world, Block's June 
9 comment is that "the market is 
signaling that a reduction in output 
is needed this year." Block told 
Congress that "I do support the use 
of credit programs to promote agri­
cultural exports." As acreage is cut 
and producers eliminated by 
Volcker, this is a rather perfunctory 
reassurance. 
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