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'Fifth Monarchy' controls shock troops 
by Christopher White 

The same Freemasonic circles who control the terrorist spon­
soring, intercontinental gun- and drug-running apparatus of 
the Italian fascist lodge Propaganda-2, also control the fun­
damentalist shock troops deployed on behalf of the Temple 
�ount consprracy. 

First, according to the press office of Buckingham Pal­
ace, Commander Buckley, aide to Prince �ichael of Kent, 
is the man to talk to about matters concerning the mooted 
reconstruction of King Solomon's Temple. Prince �ichael 
of Kent is the titular Grand �aster of the Grand �other 
Lodge of Freemasonry in London, and the figure responsible 
for the chartering of the Italian P-2 Lodge. 

Second, a prominent part is being played in the Temple 
�ount affarr by the husband-and-wife team of �ichael and 
Barbara Ledeen. Barbara Ledeen is an editorial assistant on 
the l00,OOO-per-issue circulation magazine Biblical Archae­

ology Review, which devoted its most recent cover story to 
the location of Solomon's Temple; she has described the 
project as "my baby." Her husband, a long-time protege of 
Henry Kissinger, the associate in the �onte Carlo lodge of the 
jailed Licio Gelli, has been under investigation by Italian 
authorities for his role in the crimes of the P-2 lodge. �ichael 
was most recently seen in the precincts of the U.S. State 
Department distributing the magazine to his cronies from the 
circles associated with Henry Kissinger. Ledeen was distrib­
uting the magazine to �arvin Kalb, the television journalist 
and fellow protege of Henry Kissinger, who has most re­
cently been endeavoring to shift public attention away from 
�asonic involvement in the assassination attempts against 
the Pope, for which Italian authorities are also investigating 
the P-2 Lodge. 

Thrrd, among the funding.conduits for the temple recon­
struction project must be included the Banca Commerciale 
Italiana, and the associated Fonditalia, at one time the largest 
Italian mutual fund, through the activities of one Eduardo 
Recanati (see article, page 31). The Lugano, Switzerland­
based operations of the fund have been crucial for the Temple 
�ount project. Banca Commerciale Italiana is controlled by 
�asonic sub-agents who have not yet become the public· 
focus of the P-2 investigation within Italy. 

Fourth, Asher S. Kaufman, the Hebrew University-based 
plasma physicist and amateur cult archaeologist who wrote 
the cited Biblical Archaeology Review for Barbara Ledeen, 
has been backed in his· activities by the Quatuor Coronati 
Lodge of London Freemasonry. A native of Edinburgh, Scot­
land, Kaufman is a protege of British �useum trustee T. E. 
All'ibone and the late Prof. John R. Clarke of the University 
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of Sheffield, both leading members of the Quatuor Coronati 
Lodge (see EIR, �arch 29). Now an Israeli citizen, Kaufman 
has been active in the Temple �ount operation since the 1967 
war, when Israel annexed East Jerusalem. 

The Quatuor Coronati Lodge, known as the premier lodge 
for �asonic research, has functioned as a premier cult crea­
tion center of British intelligence in its almost 100 years of 
existence to date. Among cults that have been spun off from 
the activities of that lodge was Adolf Hitler's Nazi Party, 
through such operations as the Order of the Golden Dawn 
and the Thule Society, created from within the lodge during 
earlier years of the century. The Quatuor Coronati Lodge was 
first drawn to investigators' attention in the context of last 
year's cult assassination by hanging, (underneath London's 
Blackfriars Bridge) of P-2-connected Italian banker Roberto 
Calvi. The �ilan headquarters of Calvi's bank was the lo­
cation for a major international gun- and drug-running syn­
dicate, Stibam International of Henri Arsan. This outfit was 
equipping those very �iddle Eastern deployables, primarily 
from the Franr;ois Genoud-controlled �uslim Brotherhood, 
that are being set into the mode for region-wide terrorist and 
religious war bloodbaths by the activities around the Temple 
�ount. 

This pattern should disabuse those, especially within the 
United States, who have fallen for the British-circulated line 
that their kind of Freemasonry is different than continental, 
i.e., French and Italian Freemasonry. American �asons, 
who have been receiving special briefings on the Italian de­
velopments from their controllers, have been among those 
particularly targeted by this kind of lying propaganda. Simi­
larly, the public in general has been targeted by special prop­
aganda like the recent U.S. Public Broadcasting Service pro­
gram on the P-2 affair, which sought to portray the British 
brothers as a kind of weird social club. 

In the early years of the 19th century, John Quincy Adams 
warned against the activities of the brotherhood as he led the 
fight to preserve the republic from Tory treachery represented 
by Aaron Burr and Andrew Jackson and their associates in 
the Scottish Rite. Perhaps if Adams's warnings had been 
heeded, we would not still be treating a pederast and m�rderer 
like Henry Kissinger as a respectable member of the body 
politi�. 

Adams argued at the time that membership in a secret 
brotherhood of the �asonic sort is irreconcilably opposed to 
the moral qualifications demanded of a repUblican citizen­
ship. He proved that the secret brotherhood of the �asonry 
is an irrationalist cult, and that members in that cult are ipso 
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facto incompetent to hold office in a republic. 
The point of the argument is very simple. Masons are 

required to swear a secrecy oath, on pain of a hideous death, 
before they ever discover what it is they have so sworn to 
preserve with their lives. The corpse of Roberto Calvi, pock­
ets filled with bricks, swinging under the bridge in London, 
is no doubt testimony to the seriousness of such oaths, which 
are still, as Adams pointed out, higher in authority for any 
Freemason than an oath of loyalty to the nation and its 
constitution. 

In fact the Freemasonry is the principal organizational 
glue which binds the different sections of the European oli­
garchy together, and functions as the conveyor belt for the 
sado-masochistic process known as consensus formation 
within that oligarchy's agents. The British monarchy "has 
been intimately connected with the Masonry since the insti­
tution was created by cultists from Geneva assisted by certain 
Huguenots exiled from France after the revocation of the 
Edict of Nan\es. It is tradition that the reigning British mon­
arch, if male, be the patron for the Masonry associated with 
the Grand Mother Lodge, and that the Grand Master of the 
Lodge be a member of the reigning royal family. Relatives 
of the reigning house of England from Hesse, Hannover, and 
Coburg, for example, have also traditionally held high office 
in continental European offshoots of the Masonry and affili­
ated organizations. 

This tradition is continued by the present Duke of Kent, 
and by Prince Philip, Duke of Edinburgh, whose World 
Wildlife Fund and related activities on behalf of environmen­
talism are conducted for the Masonic brotherhood. This tra­
dition is shown on this side of the Atlantic by the activities of 
Elliot Richardson, Freemason of the year in New York State 
in 1982. 

The reference point in the modem origins of the Gnostic 
cult that now goes under the name of Freemasonry is the 
Genevan and Venetian circle that sponsored the political 
career of the networks assembled around the figurehead of 
Isaac Newton, in their war against the founder of modem 
science, Gottfried Leibniz. 

Through the influence of the mystic Fatio de Duillier of 
the Genevan banking family, the Turretini family of Geneva 
bankers and the Abbe Conti of Venice, Isaac Newton w.as �ed 
to create a new form of an old religious cult to fight against 
the tendency to which he refers in his religious papers as the 
"homoousians," that is, those like Leibniz who are political 
protagonists on behalf of the principle of consubstantiality 
identified in the jilioque of the Athanasian creed. 

For Newton and his backers in Geneva and Venice, the 
would have been under the governance of the Antichrist and 
polytheism since the adoption of the cited creed in approxi­
mately 380 AD. Newton's work in optics, mechanics, alche­
my, and the interpretation of the prophecies of Daniel, and 
the Revelations of S1. John the Divine were unified under 
that obsessive rage against what he called the homoousians. 
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This obsession has, since the days of Newton, unified 
forces within and outside the Christian churches who have 
employed the secret society of Masonry, whose "sons of the 
widow" follow warmed-over homosexual and pederastic Isis 
rituals, as a bloody battering ram against their political 
opponents. 

So now, the Reverend Neville Cryer of the Church of 
England's British and Foreign Bible Society, and the Quatuor 
Coronati Lodge, can join with Brother Batham from the 
lodge, and others in the foreign policy sections of the Angli­
can Church, along with the Lausanne and Geneva circles 
associated with Franc;ois Genoud, to push for the creation of 
a decade of Northern Ireland-style religious warfare in the 
Middle East and North Africa, thereby destroying the organ­
ized basis for human existence. 

Newton's religious views are not, of course, taught in the 
schools which continue to propagate his cultish physics. But 
his religious writings, including his plans for the reconstruc­
tion of the Temple of Solomon in Jerusalem were guarded 
until this century in Trinity College, Cambridge, before being 
shipped to the same Hebrew University in Jerusalem which 
now sponsors the bogus archaeological work of Asher S. 
Kaufman for the Quatuor Coronati Lodge members in Lon­
don. The papers include Newton's treatment of the prophet 
Daniel's interpretation of Nebuchadnezzar's dreams-in­
cluding the insane conceit beloved by the Anglo-Saxon racial 
supremacists in the British lodges and within the Anglican 
Church that the British Empire is to be "The Fifth Mon­
archy ," which will rule forever. 

This outlook has been propagated by a series of Templar 
and Rosicrucian organizations within the ranks of Freema­
sonry since the inception of the organization. Notable in this 
connection are the Chevaliers Bienfaisants de la Cite Sainte, 
headquartered in Geneva, and its predecessor Templar or­
ganizations, which have been dedicated to regaining the Holy 
Land and rebuilding the Temple of Solomon. 

Such insane cult purposes are reinforced by the ritualistic 
aspects of the British monarchy, which has been the flagship 
for such activities, such as the treasured "Stone of Destiny," 
on which all rulers of Britain have been crowned during the 
last 700 years. This stone is argued to be part of the first 
Temple of Jerusalem, brought to Ireland by the Prophet Jer­
emjah, and thence successively inherited by kings of Scot­
land and Britain. The baptism of the present Queen Elizabeth 
II in waters brought from the Jordan River for the purpose is 
to be seen in this light. The Fifth Monarchy men consider 
themselves to be the heirs of King David, and Elizabeth is 
their spiritual head. 

The kind of thinking that was put into the development 
of Hitler's fascism by the forerunners of the present members 
of the Quatuor Coronati Lodge was not very different from 
this kind of psychotic belief structure. The genocidal effects 
against Jews,. Muslims, and Christians alike will not be so 
different either. 
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