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Andean Report by Valerie Rush 

CAP, Latin America's Kissinger? 

Carlos Andres Perez bears the Soviet/Wall Street seal of 

approvalfor his debt strategy. 

During one of his frequent visits to 
the United States on Sept. 21, Vene­
zuelan socialist and presidential can­
didate Carlos Andres Perez addressed 
a Harvard University seminar on Third 
World debt, at which he announced 
that "the hour of reconciliation " be­
tween creditors and debtors had ar­
rived. He proceeded to offer what he 
described as a novel plan for resolving 
the debt problem. 

His novel plan, however, proved 
to be virtually identical to the propos­
als published over the past few years 
by former Secretary of State Henry 
Kissinger. 

"Substantial reduction of resource 
transfers abroad, at the same time cre­
ating mechanisms to guarantee the flow 
of new resources . . . and as indispen­
sable counterpart, the governments of 
Latin America must commit them­
selves to conducting a disciplined eco­
nomic and financial administration, 
with the adoption of policies that pre­
vent misuse of resources, for which 
one cannot object to the participation 
of international organizations .... 
Thus will the way be paved for invest­
ments by the industrialized coun­
tries," declared Perez. 

Compare what Kissinger wrote in 
the New York Post of June 25, 1984: 

"Latin American debtors [should] be 
prepared to do their part to restart 
growth, through great efforts of eco­
nomic reform: brake inflation; modify 
factors that discourage savings and in­
vestments; eliminate subsidies to in­
efficient industries; administer a sen­
sible exchange rate policy. [They 
should adopt] serious adjustment pro-
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grams and accept the fact that incen­
tives to private investment-foreign 
and domestic-is the only path to sus­
tained growth." 

Just a coincidence that socialist 
demagogue and "Third W orldist " CAP 
should sound so like bankers' mouth­
piece Kissinger? Not really. Perez is 
providing a critical service to the in­
ternational financial community, 
which intends to put him in the presi­
dential seat in Venezuela for the next 
five years. Already, the ruling elites 
in Mexico and Colombia have em­
braced Perez's proposal. Even the Pe­
ruvian government of President Alan 
Garcia has been driven to follow suit, 
thanks to brutal pressures from Per­
ez's Socialist International. 

Perez's claim to a novel approach 
to the debt problem notwithstanding, 
he has admitted to sharing his "long­
term objectives " with such "presti­
gious personalities " as "Henry Kissin­
ger, Sen. Bill Bradley, Saburo akita, 
and banker James Robinson." He also 
embraced their "different proposals for 
creation of a multilateral agency for 
management of the debt ... [that] 
would be in charge of buying the com­
mercial bank debt of the developing 
countries at discount." 

Gone is the rhetoric against the 
"poisonous " International Monetary 
Fund, the dramatic calls for a debtor 
front, the diatribes against imperialist 
usury. In his Harvard presentation, 
Perez opposed the notion of any uni­
lateral action on the part of the debt­
ors. "The participation of the govern­
ments of the creditor countries, and 
dialogue between them and the debtor 

countries, will be indispensable in any 
scheme of negotiation that is adopt­
ed. . . . A decade of crisis has con­
vinced the developing countries that it 
is worthless to adopt isolationist or 
confrontationist positions in an inter­
dependent world." 

Perez's insistence on "reconcilia­
tion " also echoes the Soviets. Acade­
mician and Latin American specialist 
Victor Vol sky has argued against a 
declaration of moratorium by debtor 
nations, and reports that General Sec­
retary Gorbachov told President Rea­
gan of the need for an international 
conference on the debt, "because it is 
a global problem, and not merely a 
Third World one." 

The coincidence between Perez 
and the Soviets is not accidental, for 
the Venezuelan bears Moscow's stamp 
of approval. In early August, speak­
ing of the debt problem, Fidel Castro 
told his friend Perez: "You are going 
to be the President of Venezuela, and 
you should head up this unity move­
ment in defense of Latin American in­
terests." 

On the day of his Harvard presen­
tation, Perez gave an interview to UPI, 
in which he was asked whether, if 
elected President of Venezuela, he 
would act on his long-standing prom­
ise to "promote a meeting of Latin 
American heads of state on the matter 
of the debt." Perez responded: "As my 
victory already seems to be a reality, 
I have to think a good deal about these 
problems and weigh my words very 
well, so that what I said as a candidate 
does not contradict what I do as Pres­
ident. " 

Making clear why both the Soviets 
and Wall Street have endorsed his 
candidacy, Perez added: "Absolutely 
nothing will be achieved by a rupture 
of the international financial sys­
tem .... There are no longer any na­
tional economies and we will gain 
nothing with a rupture of the system." 
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