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It was none other than Adolf Hitler who observed that a big
lie will be believed sooner than a small one, and that the
extent of a lie must be so enormous, so that it overwhelms the
imagination of most people, and they will swallow it. But
Leibniz was of the opinion that the nature of man is such that
the evil in him will call forth an even greater power of good.
And Abraham Lincoln also said that one can fool all of the
people some of the time, and some of the people all of the
time, but not all of the people all of the time. At this point,
there is much that speaks to the fact that Leibniz and Lincoln
were right: The huge lie of the climate swindle is about to
become the greatest boomerang in history.

In this case, the extent of the swindle is gigantic: if the
propagandists for the so-called man-made climate change and
for the so-called efficiency of biofuels were successful, this
would mean the mass murder of billions of people. But pre-
cisely because the consequences of this policy are so huge,
an opposition-movement of politically highly diverse parties
is developing against these two eco-lies, which their inventors
would never have dreamed of.

Because while Al Gore and those hedge funds that special-
ize in CO2 emissions credits are busy rejoicing over the horror
scenarios of global warming that have been foisted on the
population, especially the children and youth, and training a
whole army of parrots, who mechanically recite Gore’s
“power-point presentation,” the opposition is growing world-
wide. The movie produced by the British TV station Channel
4, “The Great Global Warming Swindle,” which features the
doubts of renowned scientists about the actual basis for cycli-
cal swings in climate, is finding enormous interest on the
Internet.

Meanwhile, more than 17,000 American scientists,
among whom, two-thirds have top academic degrees, have
signed a petition to the American government, rejecting the
Kyoto Protocol and similar documents, on the basis of the
indefensibility of their assertions. Richard Lindzen, a clima-
tologist from MIT, attacked Gore as a pompous idiot, who
simply must be crazy. Gore “is promoting hysteria, which is
never good for democracy, and second, he has strong financial
interests. He is simply not independent,” said Lindzen, ac-
cording to the Swiss Weltwoche. Actually, Gore, who is him-
self a member of the board of directors of a hedge fund, has
an obvious conflict of interest. And the author Paul Driessen
remarked in an interview with EIR (this issue), that the emis-
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sions-trade, pure and simple, will shut down any development
in the poor countries. “When you don’t have these modern
technologies (like electricity), your life span is cut almost in
half,” Driessen explained.

The neo-liberal Czech President Vaclav Klaus has met the
CO2 hysteria of the European Union with several declarations
that, in reality, the environmental movement represents the
greatest danger for mankind. The Ugandan dictator Yoweri
Museveni called the global warming campaign an assault by
the industrial nations on Africa. The head of the Russian Envi-
ronment Agency, Alexander Bedritsky, called the possibility
of global warming a great gift from nature to frozen Siberia.
You can be absolutely sure that this debate will develop into
an avalanche which will bury the eco-lies.

The inventors of the eco-lies should be especially un-
happy about one of them: namely, that, in light of the obvious
consequences being genocide against the poor in the develop-
ing countries, the historical continuity of the ecology move-
ment with the eugenics movement of the 1920s and ’30s is
being put on the agenda. Sir Julian Huxley, who coordinated
the British eugenics project in the 1920s, and helped establish
the laws for involuntary sterilization of “inferior races” in the
United States, confirmed after World War II that you had to
call eugenics by another name, because it had been discredited
by the Nazis, and at that point couldn’t be put into effect for
a long time, for political and psychological reasons. Therefore
one must now call it “conservation,” “environmental protec-
tion,” or “ecology.”

But the historical roots of green fascism in the ideas of
Friedrich Nietzsche, Ernst and Friedrich George Jünger, the
whole Conservative Revolution with its cyclical worldview,
and the green elements of the ideology of the Nazis will now
be investigated, and publicized, as the ahistorical, hedonistic
managers of the locust funds could not have imagined in their
worst dreams. The lies about man-made climate change will
prove to be the greatest boomerang in history.
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