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Editorial

As of this writing, President Barack Obama and 
his wife Michelle are being fêted at Buckingham 
Palace by the leaders of the degenerate, genocidal 
financial oligarchy which dominates the world, 
Queen Elizabeth II and her Consort Prince Philip. 
Meanwhile, vast swaths of U.S. territory are buf-
feted by, in many cases, unprecedented tornadoes, 
floods, and rains, causing hundreds of deaths, so 
far. That contrast gives you an appropriate image 
of exactly what the relationship is between the 
44th President of the United States, and the Amer-
ican people.

As we have asserted relentlessly since before 
he was elected, Obama is a British puppet. Con-
trary to his carefully constructed public image, he 
doesn’t care about the welfare of the American 
people, the African people, or any other of the suf-
fering populations of this world; he cares about the 
ego and reputation of Barack Obama. In fact, he’s 
so passionate in his concern, that he perfectly fits 
the character profile of a pathological narcissist, 
someone so psychologically ill that he qualifies to 
be removed from the Presidency by the standards 
of the 25th Amendment to the U.S. Constitution.

Worse yet, in order to please his British mas-
ters, Obama will not only ignore the welfare of the 
American people, but he will take affirmative 
action to destroy it.

Obama’s action, and inaction, vis-à-vis the 
current wave of violent weather in the Midwest, 
underscores our point.

First, note that what we are dealing with in 
these storms, such as the unprecedented tornado 
that destroyed a large portion of Joplin, Mo., is not 
a one-time disaster. As anyone who cares can see, 
the planet as a whole is currently undergoing a 
wave of dramatic weather events, which must be 
assumed to derive from events in the Solar System, 

and the galaxy itself. Huge earthquakes, long-dor-
mant volcanoes erupting, unparalleled tornadoes, 
unprecedented bouts of rainfall—these all signify 
disturbances of our environment in the universe, 
which had better be investigated now.

On this issue, Obama is clear: He is concen-
trating on cutting the budget of those very scien-
tific institutions—such as NASA and weather sat-
ellites—which are required to understand, forecast, 
and mitigate such “natural” events.

Second, note that the huge Midwest area cur-
rently being hit, is the source of a significant 
amount of the grains produced by the United 
States. Farmers being able to reseed and rebuild 
after the floods recede, will be a matter of saving 
the core food supply of the nation! Yet the Obama 
Administration is not even acknowledging this 
problem, much less preparing to provide the re-
sources to deal with it.

Third, both the rebuilding of this area, and 
preparation to deal with forecastable future disas-
ters, depends upon a massive flow of Federal funds 
and manpower immediately. But the Obama Ad-
ministration is cutting the Army Corps of Engi-
neers budget, demanding unpayable copays for di-
saster assistance, and generally operating on a 
business-as-usual basis. That gives a sinister 
meaning to the President’s statement from Eng-
land on the Joplin disaster: “All we can do is let 
them know we care.”

That’s what Obama did in Haiti, when he re-
fused to take up plans for mass relocation and re-
building. That’s what he does for the growing ma-
jority of suffering Americans, while continuing 
massive bailouts to the Wall Street and British 
banks. That’s why he must be removed from office, 
before America suffers the Haiti treatment as 
well.

Will You Tolerate the Haiti Treatment?


