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Editorial

President Barack Obama, a servant of the British 
Empire, is not only murdering those he designates 
as enemies—without any pretext of law—but he 
is murdering the very idea of the American Re-
public. If he is not stopped, one of the noblest ac-
complishments of all mankind will have been de-
stroyed, for generations to come.

The United States republic was a product of 
ideas generated by great thinkers, ranging from 
Plato, to Nicholas of Cusa, to Gottfried Wilhelm 
Leibniz, the Mathers, and Benjamin Franklin. In 
many respects, the Treaty of Westphalia, signed 
on Oct. 24, 1648, distills those principles as they 
have been developed in the modern nation-state.

At the Peace of Westphalia, ending the Thirty 
Years War, Austria, France, Sweden, the German 
Electors, and the States of the Habsburg Empire, 
agreed 1) that priority was to be given to the Ben-
efit, Honor and Advantage of the other, and 2) that 
unless all that had been committed since the be-
ginning of the troubles was to be thrown into a 
perpetual Oblivion, the continuation of the Thirty 
Years War was going to destroy civilization. The 
laws of retribution were to be ended, and the law 
of mutual cooperation among peoples was to be 
established as the means of maintaining interna-
tional justice and peace.

Need we say that the Empire faction never ac-
cepted these principles? That rejection has been 
played out primarily, although not only, through 
the actions of the Empire based in the British Isles 
in fomenting war after war with the intent of 
wiping out this noble idea of the nation-state, and 
of man himself, and especially the premier repub-
lic, the United States of America.

In recent decades, toadies for the British finan-
cial Empire have not been shy about stating their 
intent to destroy the Treaty of Westphalia. Henry 

Kissinger, Tony Blair, the rulers of the European 
Central Bank—they all demand that “outmoded” 
national structures be superceded by what amounts 
to the international law of the jungle, whose dic-
tates are determined by an international commu-
nity of bankers.

Now add to that collection of scoundrels, the 
criminally insane Barack Obama. From the very 
beginning of his Presidency, Obama has made a 
mockery of his oath to the U.S. Constitution, by 
choosing a path of overriding basic Constitutional 
rights, in the name of “national security” and 
“economic necessity.” Now he has taken that pat-
tern to even more barbaric depths, by carrying out 
crimes, such as the murder of a 16-year-old Amer-
ican citizen, without cause, and the assassination 
of a head of state, without benefit of trial, or basic 
humanity.

Worse yet, Obama and his controllers believe 
they can count on the degradation of the U.S. pop-
ulation to ensure that these barbarities are ap-
plauded, rather than condemned by the public. 
Obama will not do what is necessary to reverse the 
global economic breakdown crisis, but he is per-
fectly happy to go to the Rose Garden to gloat 
about the latest assassination of those whom his 
Administration has put on the target list to die.

That raises the crucial question: Are there 
enough patriots, with enough influence, in the 
United States, to stand up for the actual principles 
upon which our republic was founded? If so, they 
will immediately move to Constitutionally remove 
Obama from office, and save the nation from 
physical-economic demise, by instituting Presi-
dent Franklin Roosevelt’s Glass-Steagall princi-
ple, and a credit system for reconstruction.

It’s a question of Republic vs. Empire: Where 
do you stand?
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