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Editorial

All thinking U.S. citizens know it: The choices 
before them in this Presidential election are dismal, 
even outright disgusting. The immediate central 
issue—the danger of the British-Saudi-Obama 
policy pushing us into thermonuclear war—is not 
even addressed by the candidates. And when the 
reality of the economic collapse is raised, the al-
leged solutions being put on the table—austerity 
and greenie-ism—will ensure the destruction of 
our nation.

Yet, we are less than two weeks before Election 
Day. The options for replacing these candidates 
have passed by, but we still have to save the nation. 
The unique approach for doing so, is what Lyndon 
LaRouche is addressing at some length in his 
weekly series of Friday night webcasts—but let’s 
cut to the chase.

First, Obama must not be re-elected. As a tool 
of the British monarchy, he has taken our nation on 
the course of Nazi economic policies, dictatorship, 
and unconstitutional wars that are leading to a 
direct confrontation with the world’s other major 
nuclear power, Russia. We are already in the pro-
cess of global war that puts us on the razor’s edge, 
and only the removal of Obama’s hand from the 
nuclear button gives us the chance to pull back 
from that process. There is no excuse for voting for 
Obama as the “lesser of two evils.” What is “more 
evil” than wiping out planet in a thermonuclear 
war?

As LaRouche put it Oct. 22: If Americans re-
elect Obama, they will be voting for their own ex-
tinction. And everything possible must be done to 
convince them not to do so.

But, once the immediate war danger is miti-
gated, our nation will face another peril, the poten-
tial control of a Romney Presidency by the Repub-

lican Party! If that is permitted, given the insane, 
murderous economic austerity the party as an insti-
tution is pushing, we are facing disaster of another 
sort—one that will actually achieve the British 
monarchy’s aim of depopulation by another route.

How can this be prevented? By crushing the 
political party system put in place by the British 
under Andrew Jackson! Party loyalty is a disease, a 
corruption, which violates the principles of the 
U.S. Constitution, and has never served the inter-
ests of the nation. Only when our nation has had 
leadership that stood “above party,” not as a dicta-
torship, but as an inspiration, have we prospered 
and fulfilled our mission.

George Washington and John Quincy Adams 
are sterling models of the kind of leadership we 
need, men who insisted on policies to develop the 
nation, and opposed party politics. The idea of 
choosing a national leader as you root for a sports 
team is an abomination. Party loyalty is a form of 
corruption which must be rooted out, and banned 
from controlling the national recovery policies on 
which our survival depends.

Restoring Glass-Steagall, returning to a na-
tional credit system, and launching NAWAPA—
these are the vital policies to save the nation. They 
are the property of neither party, both of which 
have so far rejected them! But these are the poli-
cies around which our citizens must rally, as indi-
viduals, and individual leaders, as we restore a true 
Constitutional republic.

Franklin Roosevelt put it clearly in his Com-
monwealth Club speech of 1932, when he said: “I 
want to speak not of politics but of government. I 
want to speak not of parties, but of universal prin-
ciples.”

Oust Obama and restore those principles, now!

No Debate, No Party Politics!


