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Editorial

The world economy must be reoriented to a newly 
defined concept of productivity, whose standard is 
currently set by the Chinese Moon program, in the 
view of U.S. economist Lyndon LaRouche. In a 
discussion with collaborators on Aug. 3, LaRouche 
stressed that all practices of cheap labor must be 
eliminated, to favor “productive labor of a high en-
ergy-flux density.” The standard for that is the Chi-
nese Moon program, aimed at developing Moon-
based helium-3 resources to feed a fusion 
energy-based economy. Once the U.S. begins to 
cooperate with China on this project, LaRouche 
stressed, “the China Moon project is the future of 
mankind.”

While the trans-Atlantic region has committed 
itself to an insane, anti-scientific, Earth-based, Lil-
liputian green policy, characterized by reduced en-
ergy-flux densities, the Chinese have defined the 
mission of their entire scientific program from the 
standpoint of space science. Since helium-3 is 
abundantly available on the Moon, but not on the 
Earth, and is much more powerful than other 
sources of fuel for fusion power found on our 
planet, the Chinese science program is actually at 
the frontier of the Solar System.

LaRouche’s recently issued “Four New Laws 
To Save the U.S.A. Now” is grounded in the re-
quirement for such a science-driver program, as 
elaborated by the great Ukrainian-Russian scien-
tist Vladimir Vernadsky. “Our job,” LaRouche ex-
plained, “is to take the biggest driver we have, and 
that is the biggest and best source of thermonuclear 
fusion, and that is the driver on which the existence 
of the human species is going to depend for the 
time to come; and we’re already in the middle of it. 
The only source of effective thermonuclear fusion 
in large mass is found on the Moon, and that’s 

where China is going, and going again, in order to 
build up the super-basis of power and energy on 
which the human species is henceforth going to 
depend. This is reality.”

“All we need is to unite a group of nations on 
Earth together, today, with China and others, who 
are cooperators on this thing, to make things 
happen that increase the energy-flux density of 
man’s productive powers of labor.”

As EIR will be elaborating in future issues, the 
Chinese space program, currently focused on the 
Moon, represents the paradigm for what must be 
done to save the dying Western economies. Just 
look around Western Europe and the United 
States. Death rates are increasing; employment, 
where it is available, is largely meaningless in 
terms of productive output for society; “profit” is 
defined in terms of how much you can steal—as 
in the case of the vulture funds now going after 
Argentina.

The trans-Atlantic region is being dominated 
by a British monetarist ideology which kills. Nu-
clear plants are being shut down, the space pro-
grams cut back, and generations left without a pur-
pose for living. Yet, right before our eyes, the Asian 
nations, such as Russia, India, and China, are strik-
ing out on a path of scientific progress which holds 
the only hope for resolving the real problems of 
drought, disease, poverty, and war.

Mankind, especially the United States, faces an 
existential choice. To continue in the current para-
digm, promises further degeneration and most 
likely, a global war. To join hands with China and 
its partners in its space program, heralds a bright 
future for all.

It’s thermonuclear fusion, or thermonuclear 
war. It’s your choice.

China’s Moon Project—Your Future


