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Editorial

EIR’s comprehensive study of the progress of the 
Eurasian Land-Bridge project which Lyndon and 
Helga LaRouche have championed for over 20 
years, has now been completed. The official re-
lease date is Dec. 1.

The 374-page report, entitled “The New Silk 
Road Becomes the World Land-Bridge,” is noth-
ing less than a conceptual, and often physical, 
“road-map” to a New World Economic Order. This 
path is currently being charted by the nations of the 
BRICS—Brazil, Russia, India, China, and South 
Africa—which are leading a dynamic of global op-
timism toward real economic development, com-
plete with new credit institutions and major high-
technology projects for uplifting all mankind.

After an introduction by Helga Zepp-LaRouche, 
the report lays out the “Metrics of Progress,” based 

on the economic-scientific principles developed by 
renowned physical economist Lyndon LaRouche. It 
then proceeds region by region, beginning with 
China and Russia, to present the stunning progress, 
and plans, which have been made toward the Eur-
asian Land-Bridge design that the Chinese govern-
ment laid out in 1996, and other nations have begun 
to rally around in recent years.

The full table of contents is available on the 
LaRouchePAC website.

The report, complete with many full-color 
maps of its featured development corridors, is now 
available in pdf format for $200, and will soon be 
available in hard copy, for $250. It puts before the 
world the vision mankind so desperately needs: a 
program of worldwide collaboration around the 
common aims of mankind.
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