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As usual, this is just my opinion, based on research of the mainstream stories anyone could do, but doesn't.

In previous papers, I have shown you much evidence the top Nazis and their generals were Jewish.  In
fact, the mainstream admits it, through both Jewish authors and Jewish websites.  See as the top
example Jewish author Bryan Rigg, and his book Hitler's Jewish Soldiers, where he admits that at least
140 top Nazi officers were Jewish, including two field marshals, twenty generals, seven admirals, and
forty colonels.  He doesn't give us a complete list of those generals in the book, but I have not seen
Rommel mentioned as one of them.  However, it is quite easy to prove that what we are normally told
about Rommel is not true.  

As just a start, see this video at youtube by Mark Felton Productions, which we are supposed to believe
has generated over a million hits since July 16 of this year.  That is, 19 days ago.  At minute 1:30 he
tells us Rommel was respected by his troops due to his humble background, his father being a
schoolmaster, while Hitler's other generals were high aristocracy.  But that claim is contradicted by the
encyclopedia sites and prominent books, where we are told Rommel's maternal grandfather Karl von
Luz was nobility.  He served in the Parliament of Wurttemberg for 21 years, and was also District
President.  He was awarded the Knight's Cross First Class, Order of the Crown, which itself conferred
ennoblement (if he didn't already have it).    

http://mileswmathis.com/hiller.pdf
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=5D0bhpf-kQ8


Note that it is a Maltese cross with lions and a crown.  He later became a Commander of that order, an
even higher honor.  

So we appear to have caught Felton lying right to our faces.  

Wikipedia tries to misdirect us by listing Rommel's mother's maiden name as von Lutz, but the name
was von Luz. Luz is the Hebrew word for almond tree.  It is easy to prove Luz is a Jewish name, since
Karl von Luz's mother was also Jewish, being a Kissling and a Dietmeier.  Any search online will show
you both names are Jewish.

Which is bad news for Frances Kissling, whose story falls apart in horrible fashion.  If you remember,
she was President of Catholics for Choice for decades, driving the abortion wedge into the Church
starting in the 1970s.  But now that we can see she was likely a crypto-Jew, that whole project starts to
make more sense.  Her maiden name was Romanski, and her mother was a Rynkiewicz, doubling and
tripling that bet.  Just so you know, both names are Jewish and come from Polish nobility.  We are told
she came out of a convent at age 19, but she actually came out of the Rockefeller-funded New School,
which settles it. 

Here is a picture of American film producer Adele Romanski, who produced Moonlight.  



That is what a Romanski looks like.  I guess we now know why Moonlight was showered with awards,
despite being unwatchable.  It is was the second lowest-grossing best picture winner, after the even
worse Hurt Locker. The Hurt Locker was a CIA-front film, which comes as no surprise to anyone, but
Moonlight was, too, which is why it promoted what it did.  We can now see it as a precursor to the
current tranny and BLM projects.  

I also point out the obvious: Romanski is a variant of. . . Romanov.  Romanski is just the Polish
equivalent of the Russian Romanov.  

Anyway, back to Rommel's mother von Luz.  On his father's side, Karl von Luz was a Keppler, a Frey,
a Staehl, a Kuebler, a Morlok, a Schettler, a Wendel, a Faist, a Schneider, a Kirn/Kuern, and a
Hummel.  It looks to me like Rommel may be a direct descendant of astronomer Johannes Kepler, who
spelled his name Keppler.  Rommel has many direct ancestors named Johannes Keppler.    

Through the von Luz name, Rommel was linked to the Mecklenburgs, since von Luz is just a variant of
von Lutzow.   As we have already seen, they added the “t” to break the obvious Hebrew link.  I remind
you that the Mecklenburgs are among the top aristocrats of Germany, being dukes since 1167.   They
are not only princes of Prussia, they have been on or near the thrones of the Netherlands, Sweden, and
Norway.  Juliana, Queen of the Netherlands until 1980, was a Mecklenburg.   Even better, it is admitted
in the mainstream that this family were formerly Obotrite nobles allied to Charlemagne back to 800AD,
and that their insignia is the Phoenician bull.



That is Ba'al/El, their chief god, who sat on the main steps at the entrance of Tyre.  That pretty much
confirms all my analysis here, doesn't it?  The Obotrites were also known as the Nortabtrezi, the
Wends, and the Reregi, due to their huge trade center Reric, currently in the Bay of Wismar.  So we
may assume the Reregi were neo-Phoenicians, or crypto-Jews.  

Through the von Lutzows, we can link Rommel to Ludwig Adolf Freiherr von Lutzow, another
Prussian Lieutenant General of the early 1800s and the Napoleonic Wars.  So Rommel was not only
nobility, he was from a long line of generals.   

Of course this means Rommel was a close cousin of Nazi Lieutenant General Karl-Juergen Freiherr
von Lutzow, who, although allegedly captured by the Red Army in 1944, wasn't tried until 1950.
Sentenced to 25 years for war crimes, he is said to have served about five, and probably served zero.
They admit he was back in Germany by 1956.  
 
Rommel also married a Jew, Lucia Mollin, who they admit was not of German ancestry. 



She was Polish and Italian, which should have bothered Hitler, but didn't.  Strange though that Rommel
was instrumental in the invasion of Poland, with a Polish Jewish wife.  Geni admits her mother's name
was Franciszka Paulina Weronika Malotka Trzebiatowski.  She was also a Gowinski.  The Gowinskis
are also von Bach-Gowinskis, Polish/Prussian nobles.  The Malotkis are also Polish nobles.  See for
example August Malotki von Trzebiatowski, a Prussian Lieutenant General from the Austro-Prussian
War of 1866.  He married a von Alvensleben, one of whom had been the last Master of the Order of
Templars.  The Malotkis had been ennobled in the 1600s by Polish King Wladyslaw, who was a Vasa.
My regular readers will key on that, since I have shown they were crypto-Jews with roots back to the
Byzantine Empire and before that to Armenia, where they were Komnenes.  

So, just to be sure you are getting it, Rommel's Polish wife was a Jewish noble in many lines, just like
he was.  She was probably a cousin, since that is how it usually works.   This is probably why Hitler
didn't have a problem with her: like Hitler and all the rest, she was hidden Jewish nobility.  

What happened to Rommel?  Felton repeats the mainstream story that he was forced to take a cyanide
pill or face worse consequences, for his part in a plot against Hitler.  But we can be sure that never
happened.  Hitler is supposed to have executed 84 of his generals, most of them in 1944-5, but as with
Hitler's own fake death, these stories were concocted to prevent us from looking for them after 1945.
Given what we now know, our default assumption should be that precisely none of them were
executed.  All these actors went into temporary exile somewhere, many of them in Brazil and
Argentina, but others no doubt went other places like Mallorca, Malta, Bermuda, Hawaii, South Africa,
Israel, England, the US, Canada, Australia, or wherever they wished.  Like von Lutzow, most of them
probably ended up back in Germany or Austria within a few years.   Rommel's wife died in Stuttgart in
1971, and his son was still there in 2013, so best guess is Rommel retired there in the 1950s or 60s, by
which time he was too old to recognize from his younger pictures.  

Now here is where it gets really good.  Rommel's famous nemesis was of course British Field Marshal
Montgomery, 1st Viscount Alamein.  Montgomery married Elizabeth Noel Hobart, and the name Noel
tells us she was also top nobility, related to the Dukes of Gordon.  Even better, her mother was Janetta
Stanley, scrubbed at thepeerage by Darryl Lundy, but obviously of the Stanleys, Earls of Derby.  She is
scrubbed everywhere else as well.  Why would anyone scrub a Stanley?  

My readers know.  It is because the Stanleys were Kings of Mann, the foremost kingmakers of
England, putting the Tudors on the throne as well as being behind the top lines of the Stuarts.  They are
now also the Murrays.  But before they were Kings of Mann, they were crypto-Jewish/Phoenician
invaders from the north, being merchant rulers of the Baltic and North Sea.  As such, they were what
we would call Vikings.  And, as I have shown, the Vikings were also descended from the same
Komnenes that came out of the area of Armenia before the time of Christ.  Long before the Stanleys
installed Henry VII, they had installed John of Gaunt in the royal household, and I have shown you
where he came from.  

Which means. . . Rommel and Montgomery were also cousins.  This shouldn't really surprise you, since
all European nobles are close cousins from the same ancient lines.  The mainstream will admit that
when pressed, though they won't admit it has anything to do with Komnenes or Phoenicians, or Jews.
But it is commonly known the noble houses of Germany and England are very closely linked, since the
Windsors are of course German.  All the royals of Germany, England, Denmark, Russia, Sweden,
Norway, the Netherlands, and many other countries are first, second, or third cousins, and though that
was admitted and widely publicized before the First World War, sometime before the Second World
War they began trying to hide it, for obvious reasons.  But it isn't just the royal houses that are
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incestuous, it is the dukes, earls, grafs, margraves, and other nobility as well.  They have been
intermarrying for centuries or millennia.  

So the idea Rommel was of humble origins is ridiculous, contradicted by mainstream evidence, telling
us Mark Felton is a shameless spinner, like every other historian.  His parents are conspicuously
scrubbed at Wikipedia and everywhere else, indicating to me he is nobility himself, probably related
through Vivienne Felton to the FitzGeralds, Dukes of Leinster; Leveson-Gores, Dukes of Sutherland;
Stewarts, Earls of Galloway; Hamiltons, Earls of Abercorn; Nevilles, Grahams, and everyone else.
That would explain his absurd levels of promotion.  More evidence of that comes from his regular
appearances at CIA-front channels Netflix, The History Channel, National Geographic, and the
American Heroes Channel.  American Heroes Channel?  Gag.  

Be prepared to gag again, since Mark informs us he was recently made a companion of MOLLUS, the
military order of the loyal legion of the US.  That's weird in one way, since Felton isn't American and
isn't military.  But in another way it is to be expected.  Here is the medal he received, to get you started:

Oh, what do you know, a Maltese cross!  Just to remind you, MOLLUS is a spooky organization
created on the day Lincoln was fake-assassinated.  They admit,

The Loyal Legion was organized largely during the same meetings that planned Lincoln's
funeral.

Since the funeral was fake, we may assume MOLLUS was fake.  The main function of MOLLUS has
always been to promote and sell fake Civil War history, including the fake assassination.  So it is
entirely apropos to see them awarding medals to spinning “historians” like Felton.  Remember,
MOLLUS was linked to the Pinkertons from the beginning, meaning it was an arm of American
Intelligence.  Many of its top members were always Presidents, generals, and other billionaires, and

http://mileswmathis.com/lincoln.pdf


here are just a few of the names on that list: 

Hayes, Sheridan, Hancock, Cadwalladr, Dodge, Melville, MacArthur, Hubbard, Mason, Forbes, Grant,
Liddell, Hammer, Frick, Harrison, McKinley, Eisenhower, Hoover, Wilson, Nimitz, Sherman, Scott,
Franklin, Greely, Howard, Robinson, Stanley, Shockley, Astor, Pratt, Adams, Clay, Walker,
Wainwright, Crowninshield, Webb, Putnam, Kellogg, Payne, Rhodes, DuPont, Douglas, Lincoln,
Palmer, Carter, Clarke, Folger, Russell, Chase, Roosevelt, Welles, Hamilton, Morgan, and the Prince of
Savoy.  

The Stanley is General David Sloane Stanley.  They really don't want us to know who he is, since all
the women in his ancestry are scrubbed, including his mother.  His father's line comes from Ashford,
Kent, which means these are the Stanley's, Earls of Derby.  He is in the direct line of the 2nd Earl,
Thomas Stanley, also linking us to the Nevilles, Montagus, Beauforts, and Tudors.  

Here's another thing worth reminding you of on the way out.  Remember Mark Felt, Associate Director
of the FBI during Watergate, its number two man?  He later claimed to be Deepthroat, but I showed
that wasn't true.  There was no Deepthroat, since the CIA ran the whole thing and didn't need an
informant to the Washington Post like that.  CIA already ran the Post, so that whole story was
misdirection.  But what I am pointing you to is the name match.  Felt is a variant of Felton.  Felt's
mother was a Clarke from Barbados and Virginia, linking us to the Presidents, but on his father's side
he was a Fuller of Salem.  In the Felt line he came from Moses Felt of Massachusetts, previously of
Heath and Reach, Bedfordshire, England.  Not coincidentally, that is where the peerage Feltons are
from.  See Sir Thomas de Felton, Knight of the Garter, from Bedford.  These Feltons hit the big time in
1690 when the 4th Baronet Felton married the daughter of James Howard, Earl of Suffolk.  Her mother
was a Villiers of the Dukes of Buckingham.  In fact, her uncle was George Villiers, 1 st Duke of
Buckingham, the famous companion of Charles I.  So that's who the Feltons are.  

Addendum, next day:  All of Felton's youtube Nazi videos are absurd, but a reader pointed me to this
one as especially revealing.  It is on the Waffen SS soldiers guarding the Nuremberg trials.  Hard to
believe anyone buys this, as it is a test of our gullibility.  SS leaders were inside being tried while the
SS was guarding the trial?  That makes sense, right? They were backed up by regular US troops, and
these US troops were wearing a shoulder patch with a swastika on it.  See minute 2:40 for a close-up
picture of this patch.  What Felton doesn't point out is that the scales of justice on this shoulder patch
appear to be floating on a river of blood (or a phoenix fire?) and a phoenix.   Do scales float?  

We are supposed to believe these SS units guarding Nuremberg were Latvian and Estonian units
captured by the Allies, I guess making us think they were not really Nazis, but Felton admits just before
this that the Baltic States were willing allies of the Germans, since the Germans had liberated them
from the Russians.  So this doesn't begin to explain anything, since the last thing you do is put your
enemy in charge of your war trials.  That goes without saying.  Felton continues to spin, by saying that
these Baltic SS troops had nowhere to go.  Really?  Why not send them back to Estonia and Latvia?
How could these former enemies be enlisted as guards?  Felton tells us it is because huge numbers of
US servicemen were demobilized and the Allies had no choice but to trust these Baltic Nazi troops.
That's what they decided to go with?  Amusingly, Felton even claims that the Allies were short of
troops in Nuremberg because they were “guarding against a future Soviet invasion of Western Europe”.
Good lord, do they think you are stupid.

At minute 6:20, Felton says,

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=_qcEFnGeZ6A
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=_qcEFnGeZ6A
http://mileswmathis.com/watergate.pdf
http://mileswmathis.com/watergate.pdf


The US Army officially declared that recruiting former Waffen SS soldiers from the Baltic states
was OK, since although the SS were an outlawed paramilitary association, the US understood
that Latvian and Estonian soldiers had served in as conscripts, and not as ideological volunteers. 

What?  Felton just admitted the Baltic states were willing allies of the Germans, who had liberated
them from the hated Russians.  If these soldiers were conscripted, they were conscripted by their own
governments, not by the German state.  Besides, by 1945 there was nothing “paramilitary” about the
SS.  It had perhaps started out as paramilitary in the 1920s, but after the Nazis rise to power in the
1930s, it was the state military, with nothing “para” about it.  Beyond that, it is worth reminding you
that it is Nuremberg that outlawed the SS.  You can't logically outlaw the SS and at the same time hire
it as a guard.  That would be like Roman Polanski hiring the Manson family to mow his lawn in 1970.  

It is admitted that these Baltic SS soldiers had day-to-day contact with SS officers in prison, which
even Felton admits is “extraordinary”.  But it is far more than extraordinary, considering we had
allegedly just waged a World War and killed millions of people in order to capture these people and
bring them to justice.  As I see it, there are only two ways to explain it: the Allied leadership were
permanently shell-shocked and had lost their feeble minds, losing any last vestige of rationality; or we
have found yet another indication the whole thing was staged.  You decide.  


